
$599,999 - 200 Brierhill Boulevard, Wilkeson
MLS® #2363259 

$599,999
3 Bedroom, 2.5 Bathroom, 1,849 sqft
Residential on 0.11 Acres

Wilkeson, Wilkeson, WA

This beautifully crafted 3-bed, 2.5-bath, 1,874
sq. ft. home is packed with thoughtful
upgrades and custom touches. The
MAIN~FLOOR PRIMARY SUITE features a
luxurious 5-piece en suite with a soaking tub,
stylish barn door, and walk-in closet. Youâ€™ll
also love the dedicated office space OR dining
area, convenient mudroom w/ built-in bench,
and heat pump with A/C for year-round
comfort. The kitchen is a chefâ€™s dream
with quartz countertops, stainless steel
appliances, and plenty of storage (ALL
apliances stay). upstairs is a cozy bonus room,
2 additional bedrooms and a full bathroom. NO
HOA!! All in the heart of Wilkeson, a town full
of small-town charm. This is far from your
typical cookie-cutter homeâ€”every detail has
been carefully designed.

Built in 2023

Essential Information

MLS® # 2363259

List Price $599,999

Sale Price $599,999

Price Per SqFt $324

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.5

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,849



Acres 0.11

Year Built 2023

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Sold

Community Information

Address 200 Brierhill Boulevard

Area 111 - Buckley/South Prairie

Subdivision Wilkeson

City Wilkeson

County Pierce

State WA

Zip Code 98396

Amenities

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Attached Garage, RV Parking

Garage Spaces 2

Interior

Interior Features Bath Off Primary, Double Pane/Storm Window, French Doors, Water
Heater

Appliances Dishwasher(s), Microwave(s), Stove(s)/Range(s)

Exterior

Exterior Features Cement/Concrete

Lot Description Corner Lot, Curbs, Paved, Sidewalk

Foundation Poured Concrete

School Information

District White River

Elementary Wilkeson Elem

Middle Glacier Middle Sch

High White River High

Additional Information

Days on Market 123

Cumulative Days on Market 123

Days on Website 133


